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WASHINGTON, DC – The U.S. Department of Labor’s Occupational Safety and Health 
Administration (OSHA) published a final on November 7, 2018 that clarifies certification 
requirements for crane operators, and maintains the employer’s duty to ensure that crane 
operators can safely operate the equipment. The final rule will maintain safety and health 
protections for workers while reducing compliance burdens. Under the final rule, 
employers are required to train operators as needed to perform assigned crane activities, 
evaluate them, and document successful completion of the evaluations. Employers who 
have evaluated operators prior to December 9, 2018, will not have to conduct those 
evaluations again, but will only have to document when those evaluations were 
completed. 
 
The rule also requires crane operators to be certified or licensed, and receive ongoing 
training as necessary to operate new equipment. Operators can be certified based on the 
crane’s type and capacity, or type only, which ensures that more accredited testing 
organizations are eligible to meet OSHA’s certification program requirements. The final 
rule revises a 2010 requirement that crane operator certification must specify the rated 
lifting capacity of cranes for which the operator is certified. Compliant certifications that 
were already issued by type and capacity are still acceptable under this final rule. 
 
The final rule, with the exception of the evaluation and documentation requirements, will 
become effective on Dec. 9, 2018. The evaluation and documentation requirements will 
become effective on February 7, 2019. 
 
Under the Occupational Safety and Health Act of 1970, employers are responsible for 
providing safe and healthful workplaces for their employees. OSHA’s role is to help 
ensure these conditions for America’s working men and women by setting and enforcing 
standards, and providing training, education and assistance. For more information, visit 
www.osha.gov. 
 
Even though you may not have a crane operator working for your company, this standard 
may apply to your facility. If you have a contractor on your site performing crane activity, 
you need to make sure through contractor orientation that the crane operator has been 
properly trained. I used to require crane operators show their annual certification of the 
crane, the daily inspection, crane capacity chart in the crane as well as completing my 
own crane operating checklist. You may want to review your contractor requirements 
pertaining to crane operator training.  

 
Questions? Contact The Redstone Group at 614-763-5034 x7007 or jwilliams@redstonegrp.com 


